
To: i iiiiiiinueevacationggmailcom] 
From: 
Sent Wed 3/16/2016 8:57:15 PM 
Subject: Kathy Ruemmler and Dangene 

Jennie says Dangene comped Kathy for her appointment and all the products she purchased 
today! Apparently Kathy loved EVERYTHING and booked an entire year with Dangene (52 
appointments) and paid for it already...Dangenc gave her a discount off all her appointments for 
the year... 

On Mar 16, 2016, at 4:30 PM, Jeffrey E. <jeevacationagmail.com> wrote: 

tell dangene I will pay for kathy s stuff, not her 
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