
To: 
From: jeri ll 
Sent Thur 3/17/2016 9:08:30 PM 
Subject: Re: Kathy/Dangene packages 

Yes 

On Thursday, 17 March 2016 wrote: 

Kathy purchased 2 separate packages with Dangene. One for $9000 plus tax and one for 
$3000 plus tax. 

Jeffrey, do you want me to tell Kathy you are paying for this? 
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