From:
Sent: Thur 3/10/2016 8:16:37 PM
Subject: Re: Hasty Pudding Gala 4/11/16 - Follow Up

o -

(no worries! happens all the time!)

On Mar 10, 2016, at 3:08 PM. Marie-Cecile Girard-Jones

Sorry for misspelling your namc- |
On Thu, Mar 10, 2016 at 3:07 PM, || o<

Hi Marie-Cecile. 1 will have to let Bella answer this question. | have never her of
Gratitude American, LTD, but perhaps it is an entity of Jeffrey’s I am just
unfamiliar with!

I'm sure Bella will respond soon...thanks for letting us know. -

On Mar 10, 2016, at 3:05 PM, Marie-Cecile Girard-Jones

i and Bela-

[ just received a check for $50K from Gratitude America, Ltd, which came with a
contribution card with no donor's name and was simply addressed to
the hasty Pudding institute w/o a contact name - [ assume it's
Jeffrey's donation, but | wanted to double check with you that it's the
case!

Thanks and best regards,

Marie-Cecile

On Tue, Mar 8, 2016 at 11:16 AM, Marie-Cecile Girard-Jones

We will, no worries!
Thanks again!

On Tue, Mar 8, 2016 at 10:48 .—";I"'.*L_ wrote:
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Marie-Cecile and Monica, can you please keep an eye out for the
check and confirm when you receive it for us?

Very Sorry it was not posted to anyones attention. ... would think
you should have by Friday for sure...

On Mar 8, 2016, at 10:45 AM, bellaklein _ wrote:

check was mailed yesterday to the address that you
requested, but without Monica attention.

Thank you,
Bella

WIrote:

On Mar 8. 2016. at 10:19 .an-L-

| believe it was sent yesterday to Monica's attention. | am double
checking

Sent from my 1Phone

On Mar &, 2016, at 10:04 AM, Marie-Cecile Girard-Jones

Hi- the check should
be sent to my attention
(Marie-Cecile Jones).
Thanks again so much for
Jeftrey's continued and
gﬂHCTﬂLIR SLIFIFI{JI'[!

We will be in touch towards the end of the month for the guest
list for the table.

Cheers,

Marie-Cecile
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On Mon, Mar 7, 2016 at 5:04 PM, Monica Sovemi

L wrote:

1 -

Please send the check to 717 Fifth Ave, 18th Floor. Thanks
so much, and we look
forward to seeing you at the
OGS Gala this year!

Monica Soyemi

On Mon. Mar 7. 2016 at 4:42 PM,_

wrote.

Hello Momnica. ..we will be
sending a check for
550,000 for the Hasty
Pudding event.. .please
advise if we should
messenger the check to you
at 717 Fifth Ave, 18th
Floor....or to who/where?
thank you!

On Mar 2, 2016, at 1:57
PM, Monica Soyemi

rg=> wrote:
Dear Mr,
Epsten,

Per Andrew Farkas, we understand that you'll once again
be supporting
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the Hasty
Pudding Order
of the Golden
Sphinx Gala
this year.
Thank vou
very much for
your generous
contribution
and continued
support. Please
find attached a
contribution ca
rd to facilitate
payment, let us
know if you
have any
questions.

Best regards,

Monica Soyemi

=2016 contribution card 50 .docx>

Marie-Cecile Girard-Jones
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Marie-Cecile Girard-Jones

I*Imilc- Maolble -

Marie-Cecile Girard-Jones

Marie-Cecile Girard-Jones

I‘Imm::- Tr{nlelu:_
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