From:
Sent: Wed 1/27/2016 12:56:30 PM
Subject: Re: e-mail from Arthur

Hi Kelen! Jeffrey says YES to contractor coming too!!

Sent from my iPhone

On Jan 27, 2016, at 6:50 AM, Studio Arthur Casas _ wrote:

Just let him know there is no charge on that, the contractor it's gonna pay for
himself in case Jeffrey agree.
Thanks,

Done!

Sent from my iPhone

On Jan 27, 2016, at 6:00 AM, Studio Arthur ('asas_wmlc:
Ih'au'- would you send it to Jellrey, rom Arthur, please,
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Dear Ji:ﬁ'n.'}'_

My contractor from WY and Miami will be in Flonda on Saturday, 1t wonld be great if he could meet us
in 5t. Thomas to see the site and discuss logistics for this project. He is an excelent
option lor this work, Would be possible to have him gomg along wiath us?

Best, Arthur.

KELEN BIGHETTI
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