
To: 
From: Richard Kahn 
Sent: Mon 2/1/2016 10:22:55 PM 
Subject: Re: wire was sent :) 

great 
see you wednesday in the rain... 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

> On Feb 1, 2016, at 5:22 PM, Lesley Groff <lesley.jee@gmail.com> wrote: 

> Received from Southern Financial LLC 5100,000! 

> • THANK YOU!!! 

> • On Feb 1, 2016, at 5:18 PM, Richard Kahn wrote: 

» please confirm receipt 
» thanks 

>> Richard Kahn 
>> HBRK Associates Inc. 
>> 

>> 
>> 

>> 

>> 
>> 
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