
To: 
From: Michelle 
Sent: Fri 1/15/2016 8:27:56 PM 
Subject: RE: Eric Krempp's Reimbursement 

Hi 

You can just send everything to him directly. We are not charging Mr. 
Epstein a fee for the one day trial. 

How did Eric do today? 

Michelle 

Employment Counselor 
Regal Domestics, Inc. 

fax 
www.regaldomesticsinc.com 

 Ori anal Messa•e 
From: 
Sent: Friday, January 
To: Barbara Goldman 
Subject: Eric Krempp's Reimbursement 

15, 2016 3:13 PM 

Hi Michelle...where should we send Eric's reimbursement check once it is written? 
I would think we can send to him early next week...but I didn't know if it needs 
to go to you first or where? 

Thanks, 
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