
To: 
Cc: 
From: James ce I personal genius 
Sent Thur 1/14/2016 5:10:02 PM 
Subject Re: James 

: Bella Klein 

Hi Lesley / Bella, 
wants to keep the external drive I used to free space on computer so we could backup her 

phone. The drive costs $99; I'll add it as an expense on my next invoice, if that's okay? 

James Ce 
your Personal Genius 

Certified Support Professional 10.6 
hno://personaloenius.us 

On Jan 5, 2016, at 5:25 PM, fames I personal genius 
wrote: 

Absolutely. I'll see you at I PM tomorrow. 

Are you still in=? 

Thanks, 

James Ce 
your Personal Genius 

Certified Support Professional 10.6 

http://personalgenius us 

On Jan 5, 2016, at 5:18 PM, 

Can we do 1 pm please ? I need the earliest time 
Thank you 

Sent from Yahoo Mail for iPhone 

On Tuesday, January 5. 2016. 5:17 PM, jams personal genius 

> wrote: 

EFTA R1_00608423 
EFTA02061854



wrote: 

Hi M, 

I have time tomorrow between 1 - 4PM, does that work? 

James Ce 
your Personal Genius 

Certified Support Professional 10.6 

http://personalgenius.us 

On Jan 5, 2016, at 4:27 PM, wrote:

Thank you , I know I was at the Apple Store 
I can't do back up on my phone because I 
also have trouble w laptop , so I need James 
help first 
Thank you 

Sent from Yahoo Mail for iPhonq 

On Tuesday, January 5. 2016 4:19 PM. Lesley Groff 
wrote: 

Hi James. Is it possible for you 
to go see at her apartment 
tonight or tomorrow morning? 
Lesley 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Jan 5, 2016, at 4:10 PM, Ma n
wrote: 

Hello Lesley , I 
broke my phone 
and have trouble 
with computer , 
I need James help 
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tonight or 
tomorrow morning 

, please , it's very 
important otherwise 
I can't deal with 
anything . 
Thank you very 
much 

Sent from Yahoo Mail for iPhone 
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