To:  pellakiein G

From: I

Sent: Wed 1/20/2016 7:49:54 PM

Subject: Re: Clyde - for JE insurance

Yes and yes. She does have a copy. Will remind her to use it

Sent from my iPhone

On Jan 20, 2016, at 2:10 PM. bellaklein _ wrote:

Hil.
Please submut the attached receipt from Clyde to the insurance company for
reimbursement, as did not use his insurance for mediation. | just emailed
Clyde JE insurance card on file. Should girls have it in the wallet for his
medication?

Thank you,

Bella

Begin forwarded message:

From: [N

Subject: Message from KMBT_C253
Date; ‘03:43 PM EST
To:
Reply-To: sc
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