
To: Rich Kahn[ 
From: 
Sent Wed 1/20/2016 10:46:52 PM 
Subject Fwd: Renewal for 12.2015- 12.2016 

FYI. I have sent this message on to dr Kruger 

Sent from my iPhone 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: "jeffrey E." <jeevacation@ernail.com>
Date: January 20 2016 at 5:34:53 PM EST 
To: 
Subject: Re: Renewal for 12.2015- 12.2016 

when can we sign up for 10k for all 

On Wed, Jan 20, 2016 at 4:32 PM, > wrote: 

Sent from my iPhone 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Bernard Kruger •l ininiMMII> 
Date: Janus 20 2016 at 4:08:54 PM EST 
To: 
Subject: e: enewa or . .016 

Jeffrey called last week and said he was renewing. Bernard 
Sent from my iPhone 

On Jan 20, 2016, at 3:40 PM, 
wrote: 

Thank you. Will let you know! 

Sent from my iPhone 
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On Jan 20, 2016, at 3:33 PM, Bernard 
Kruger <bertiardki twerny@gmail.com>
wrote: 

Dear Lesly, 

As per our conversation, I am attaching the 
renewal invoice for Mr. Jeffery Epstein for 
the 2016 yearly retainer. Please let me know 
if he will be renewing for the year 2016 and 
if you have any questions regarding the 
concierge service let me know! 

Thanks, 

Wendy 

The Office of Bernard Kruger, M.D. 

170 East 78th Street 

Ncw York, NY 10075 

T: (212) 772-9222 F: (212) 879-7235 

<JEFFREY EPSTEIN.doc> 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
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communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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