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From:

Sent: Tue 1/26/2016 4:43.06 PM
Subject: Fwd: Costs to St. Thomas

FYI! We will be getting a bill for all this!
Sent from my iPhone

Begin forwarded message:

From: "jeffrey E." <jecvacation(@gmail.com>
Date: January 26, 2016 at 11:40:12 AM EST
To:
Subject: Re: Cosis to St. Thomas

Ok

On Tuesday., 26 January 2016, | -

Please approve the total cost for Arthur Casas $4671.94 (below is the breakdown
from Kelen in Arthur’s office)

Begin forwarded message:

From: Studio Arthur Casas JllIIINENEGEGEGEGEGEGEGEGEGEGEE

Subject: Costs to St. Thomas
Date: January 26, 2016 at 10:00:55 AM EST
To:

Dear Il 1'd appreciate to have your agreement on te costs for purchasing the
tickets below for Arthur to change his trip and fly to St Thomas and
meet Jeftrey and the Island, as well as the hotel booking;

The fare difference for the air ticket exchange costs - US

1.749,00 + penalty US 350,00
CASAS/ARTHUR

Cia

e Voo Origem Destino Partida Chegada Equipamento
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Marriott Hotels & Resorts Reservation

Reservation Confirmation: _
For Mr. Arthur Casas

CHECK-IN DATE

Thursday, January 28,

2016

CHECK-IN TIME 04:00 PM
CHECK-OUT DATE
Friday, January 29, 2016
CHECK-OUT TIME 11:00 AM

Thursday, January 28, 2016-Friday, January 29, 2016
1 night 409,00 USD

Best Available rate, a resort fee applies, based upon
availability, see Rate details

ESTIMATED GOVERMMENT TAXES & FEES 51.12UsD
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Resort fee 45.00 USD
Total for stay (per room) 505.12 USD

By vour approval, |11|_'£|.~|c kindly wire the Total Amount to the account below,

As we do not have too many options of flights [ kindly appreciate to have your approval shortly as so we can change his
ticket and purchase evervthing;

Bank Name: CitiBank

Bank Routing # -

swift Code: NGNGB

| look forward to hearing from you shortly.
Thank you,

KELEN BIGHETTI
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please note
The information contained in this communication is
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It 15 the property of
JEE
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation(@gmail.com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved

EFTA_R1_00609436
EFTA02062527



