
To: 
From: Bella Klein 
Sent Sun 1/24/2016 1:25:17 AM 
Subject: Re: Sirus XM needs a payment 

Is it your car 

Thank you, 

Bella 

> On Jan 23, 2016, at 6:54 PM, wrote: 

> Rec'd automated msg that Sirius XM needs a paytmen.t....no account number was 
given 
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