
To: 
From: 
Sent: X2/22/2015 5:45:40 PM 
Subject: Re: Fekkai charge on 11/27 and 12/01 both 235.13 

I did not make those appointments.. 

On Dec 22, 2015, at 12:42 P14, bellaklein > wrote: 

> Hi III, 
> Please confirm Fekkai appointments 
> Thank you, 
> Bella 
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