
To: 
From: bellaklein 
Sent Tue 12/22/2015 9:03:09 PM 
Subject Re: checks? 

if not received, will reissue .. 
Thank you, 
Bella 

> On Dec 22, 2015, at 3:46 PM, wrote: 

> • looks like it! thanks 

> • on Dec 22, 2015, at 3:36 PM, bellaklein > wrote: 

>> yes, have to wait some more.. 
>> Thank you, 
» Bella 

>> 

>» On Dec 22, 2015, at 3:28 PM, wrote: 
>>> 
>>> Hi Bella-you sent my reimbursement check and bonus check to me beginning of 
last week, right? I think it was the 15th... I still have not rec'd them ...you 
sent to: 
>» 
>» 
>» 
>>> 

>» just wanted to double check! thanks, 
>> 
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