To: Larry Visosk

From:

Sent: Sat 12/19/2015 5:42:26 PM
Subject: Fwd: Mandarin Marrakech

FYI
Sent from my iPhone
Begin forwarded message:
From: "jeffrey E." <jeevacation(@gmail.com>
Date: December 19, 2015 at 12:39:09 PM EST

To:
Subject: Re: Mandarin Marrakech

ask tomorw

Only the mandarin pool suite and oriental pool suite are available Dec 25-29. The
mandarin requires payment in full upon reservations as we are within their
cancellation period. Once we book our money is spent. Please advise if [ should
book you either suite! Thx

MANDARIN POOL VILLA- 1150.00 EUE

ROYAL SUITE -2 BEDROOM - 2500.00 EUR
ORIENTAL POOL VILLA - 2850.00 EUR

Sent from my iPhone

please note
The mformation contained in this communication is
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It 1s the property of
JEE
Unauthonized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
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communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation(@gmail.com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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