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Subject Re: misc. 

Nili Priell 

Tue 11/24/2015 9:49:12 PM 

Jeffrey is the BEST! I will let him know you are pleased..and thank you for 
letting me know your schedule...I will have Tess clean Thursday 3rd and then we 
will circle back to this when you return! 

On Nov 24, 2015, at 4:40 PM, Nili Priell Barak a wrote: 

> Dear
> It is too generous of Jeffrey. We appreciate it very much. No words.... 

> • Concerning Tess - we came this time for a short while. We return to Israel on 
December 3. Then we will come back to NY on December 25 for a longer period. 
> So Tess can come on Thursday 3 (we will leave early afternoon) and then only 
after our return. There is no need to clean while we will be away. 

> Nili 

> On Nov 24, 2015, at 5:33 PM, wrote: 

>> Hi again Nili_I have spoken with Jeffrey and wants to pay for the piano moving 
as a gift! No worries on reimbursing him_He is happy Ehud is happy! 

» On another note, Tess will be taking Nov. 30-Dec. 2 off as her son has joined 
the military and she will be seeing him off for his deployment. Also, this is 
Thanksgiving week...Can we start up your cleaning schedule on Thursday Dec. 3 and 
then continue with the Monday and Thursday cleaning schedule? (so she will come 
Mon. Dec. 7, Thurs. Dec. 10 and so on...) 

» Take care, 

» • On Nov 24, 2015, at 9:10 AM, Nili Priell Barak a> wrote: 

>» Dear 
>>> We have arrived and found the piano. I can see the pleasure that Ehud had to 
see it as he dreamt. He didn't unpack or anything, and straight away went to the 
piano. He is playing since (but I don't hear a thing as he is with the earphones. 
Great). Thanks. 
>» 
>> Can you please give me the swift bank account so I can transfer the payment. 
Please let me know the total sum with tips and everything. 
>>> 
>» I brought the signed paper for the anniversary. How would you like to receive 
it? 
>» 
>>> The flight was long and tough this time, but we are glad to be here. A lot of 
changes in the appartment. It looks like home. 
>» 
>» thanks, 
>» Nili 
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