
To: Richard Kahn 
Cc: 
From: athy Ruemmler 
Sent Tue 11/24/2015 4:36:21 PM 
Subject Re: TV Bracket 

Ok; great. Thanks, Richard. 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Nov 24, 2015, at 6:00 AM, Richard Kahn wrote: 

Jeffrey did not like the range of motion of the brackets on Best Buy website 
(where TV was purchased) 
I ordered bracket from Amazon and it will be arriving Friday (probably left on 
your doorstep if not home) 
Maybe you can offer the Best Buy guys extra money for them to set up as well 

I believe James said you were waiting for cable wire to be run before he visits 
Please advise when would be a good time for James to visit Washington 

Thank you and Happy Thanksgiving 

Order Details 
Ordered on November 24, 2015 Order# 110-4386381.0372258 

View or Print invoice 

Shipping Address 

Kathy Ruemmler 

BETHESDA, MD 20816-1619 
United States 

Payment Method 

"'4641 
Order Summary 

Item(s) Subtotal: 
$69.99 
Shipping & Handling: 

$0.00 
Total before tax: 

$69.99 
Estimated tax to be collected: 

$0.00 
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Grand Total: 

$69.99 

Arriving Friday 
Preparing for Shipment 

Track package 

Mount-It! MI-319L Full-Motion Tilting, Swivel, Articulating LCD TV Wall Mount Bracket with 

Extendable Swing Out Arm for 42" to 70" Flat Screen Panel L 
Sold by: Value Max 

$69.99 
Condition: New - Most orders ship same day. 

Buy it Again 

Request cancellationArchive order 

Shipping speed 

Two-Day Shipping 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
Ncw York, NY 10022 
tel 
fax 
cell 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: "jeffrey E." <jeevacation@qmail.com>
Date: November 23, 2015 at 10:31:49 AM EST 
To: Richard Kahn , Kathy 
Ruemmler 

we should in addition tot the tv get a heavy duty swivel for the tv , so when the 
fireplace is on she can swivel it out of the way, 
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please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to Lees acation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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