
To: 
From: 
Sent: 
Subject: Re: De Kruger 

es ey ro ' 
Mon 12/7/2015 4:17:09 PM 

Thank you 

Sent from my iPhone 

> On Dec 7, 2015, at 11:13 AM, 
wrote: 

awesome thank you Les! 

> • Envoye de mon iPhone 

>> On Dec 7, 2015, at 10:43 AM, Lesley Groff a> wrote: 

>> FYI. Dr Kruger does not take insurance. I let them know he will be paying for 
his appointment. Can you please give me s cell number? Krugers office is 
asking for it. 

» Sent from my iPhone 

>> On Dec 7, 2015, at 10:26 AM, 
wrote: 
>>> 
>» Amazing thank you! No, III will pay the bill himself:) 
>>> 
>» Envoye de mon iPhone 

>>>> On Dec 7, 2015, at 10:16 AM, Lesley Groff wrote: 
>>» 
>>>>= has a 1 pm appt with Dr Kruger tomorrow. Is dr Kruger to send the bill 
to Jeffrey? 
>>>> 
»» Sent from my iPhone 
>>>> 
>»» On Dec 7, 2015, at 9:24 AM, 
wrote: 
>>>>> 
>»» Terrific! Thank you 
>>>» 
>>>» Envoye de mon iPhone 
>>>» 
>>»» On Dec 7, 2015, at 9:20 AM, Lesley Groff > wrote: 
>>>>>> 
>>»» They open at 10. Will call then 
>>>>>> 
>>>>>> Sent from my iPhone 
>>>>» 
>>>»» On Dec 7, 2015, at 9:06 AM, 
wrote: 
>>>>>» 
>>>»» Hi Les, 
>>>>>>> 
>>>>>» JE asked me to contact you in order to make an appointment with dr Kruger 
asap - it's for If there any chance to see him tmw or wed? Thank you! 
>>>>>>> 
>>>»» Envoye de mon iPhone 
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