
To: Peggy Siegal 
Cc: Andres Ferran =.1; Peggy Siegal 
From: 
Sent Mon 11/16/2015 11:24:35 PM 
Subject Re: Jeffrey Epstein 

Ok great! thank you! 
I emailed Jackie today...hope to hear from her soon! thanks, Lesley 

On Nov 16, 2015, at 6:23 PM, Miliplail lillalavrote: 

Yes...1 am around. Jackie has my schedule. 

Please tell Jeffrey that paid me the 90,000 he owed me for a year. 
Peggy 

Sent from my BlackBerry 10 smartphone. 
Original Message 

From: 
Sent: Monday, November 16, 2015 6:14 PM 
To: Peggy Siegal 
Subject: Jeffrey Epstein 

Hi Peggy...Jeffrey will be in town this Wed-Fri...are you around? 

:) Lesley 
Assistant to Jeffrey Epstein 
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