To: Rich Kahn

From:

Sent: Tue 11/3/2015 4:31:04 PM
Subject: Re: lon Micola

JE said to have Ion keep his current ticket...so he can get to work for you this
Friday! I will tell Ion

On Mov 3, 2015, at 11:18 AM, Richard Kahn m wrote:

> 1 would menticon teo jee that there will be change fee charges and potentially a
more expensive flight

» please ask jee if we shall still have him delay or come and begin merwin work
and 301 work

> Richard Eahn
> HBRK Assoclates Inc.
> 575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor

> New York, NY L0022
> tel

> fax

> ocel

.

>> on wov 3, 2015, at 11:10 av, | -

below from Ion...do we just t
m to come on this Thursday: a

W

it since Jeffrey doesn't want
eimburse him the charges?

W
[T

ell him to change
nd then we will r

WO

>» hi lesley,

> ,.1 called this morning klm and after half hour on the phone they couldn't
tell me how much should i pay if i change the flight. they said that they have
to do it manually because it didn't work online.. and they can give me an answer
tomorrow afternocon at the earliest.

>> 1 dont kKnow what to do now? Just walt?

el

»>> thank wvou,

> ion
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-
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