From:
Sent: Tue 1072772015 2:56:55 PM
Subject: Re: Dr Fisch

ok thanks

On Oct 27, 2015, at 10:41 AM, bellaklein <bklein573@dgmalil.com> wrote:

lease submit for insurance reimbursement for JE

» <JEE Dr. Harry Fisch check 852 2400 102715.pdf><JEE Dr. Harry Fisch chec
821 450 102615.pdf>
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