
To: Merwin Dela cruz 
Cc: Leo Richard 
Kahn 
From: 
Sent: 
Subject: 

bellaklein 
Tue 10/27/2015 3:03:18 PM 
Re: Need check for $2400 for ultrasound 

ok 
Thank you, 
Bella 

On Oct 27, 2015, at 11:02 AM, Merwin Dela cruz 
wrote: 

Leo is on his way. 

On Oct 27, 2015, at 10:32 AM, 
wrote: 

Great. Thx 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Oct 27, 2015, at 10:29 AM, bellaklein 

Thank you, 
Bella 

It will be ready in 2 minutes 

On Oct 27, 2015, at 10:26 AM, 
wrote: 

wrote: 

Bella, please write the check for $2400 and we will have Leo pick up 
...we need for Jeffrey's appointment at 2pm 
but he is leaving house around noon for 
another doctor...Leo, please go pick up 
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check as soon as possible...thanks 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: "jeffrey E." 
<ieevacationOoma corn> 
Subject: Re: Need check 
for $2400 for ultrasound 
Date: October 27, 2015 at 
10:24:38 AM EDT 
To: 

yes 

On Tue, Oct 27, 2015 at 10:24 
wrote: 

Dr. Fisch will need a check for 
$2400 at 2pm for ultrasound... 
do we have approval for Bella 
to write check? 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail,com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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