
To: Bella Klei 
From: 
Sent: Tue 10/27/2015 3:12:22 PM 
Subject: Re: Jeffrey to see Dr.Rawlins today at 12:30 

i did not pay 
On Oct 27, 2015, at 11:09 All, bellaklein wrote: 

> did you give Amex for copay? or somebody will pay 
> Thank you, 
> Bella 

>> On Oct 27, 2015, at 11:07 All wrote: 

>> Jeffrey will be seeing Dr. Rawlins today at 12:30 
» I'm sure we will get invoices...I did give them his insurance however! 
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