
To: 
From: Bella Klein 
Sent: Tue 10/6/2015 10:21:42 PM 
Subject: Re: JE paid for Dinner at Carlyle for Chomsky's Oct. 5th 

Ok 

Thank you, 

Bella 

> On Oct 6, 2015, at 6:12 PM, wrote: 

> Bella, JE paid for the Chomsky's to have dinner at the Carlyle on Oct. 5th—we 
added in a 208 tip...I am not sure of the total cost. 

> If we need a receipt we can call John: 
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