
To: 
From: 
Sent: Thur 10/15/2015 5:50:37 PM 
Subject: Re: $200 credit on JE's Amex 

ok 
Thank you, 
Bella 

Tel: 

> On Oct 15, 2015, at 1:38 PM, wrote: 

> • Bella, you should see a $200 credit on JE's amex come through...Natasha is 
giving this to us because she made an error with me and is 'fixing' it with the 
$200 credit back to JE'S card....(the error cost us 8200 and she is giving us 
$200 so it is a wash) 
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