To: Bella Klein

From:

Sent: Thur 10/15/2015 8:04:31 PM
Subject: Re: Credit for Hotel Manapany?

ok...will check on it
On Oct 15, 2015, at 4:03 PM, bellaklein — wrote:

nop
Thank you,
Bella

On Oct 15, 2015, at 3:59 PM, |

Wrote:

did we get credit from Hotel Manapany Sain in St. Barths? Rec.
Loc#BPXRIL for $2951.12
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