
To: Dr. Bruce Moskowitz[MIIIIMM 
From: Lesley Groff 
Sent Mon 10/12/2015 8:11:17 PM 
Subject Re: Jeffrey Epstein 

thanks! 
On Oct 12, 2015, at 4:06 PM, Sarah Dolezal < wrote: 

correct 

On Mon, Oct 12, 2015 at 4:02 PM, Lesley Groff wrote: 

just want to make sure...this MRI is WithOUT contrast? he doesn't need to fast 
or anything, right? 
On Oct 12, 2015, at 3:52 PM, Sarah Dolezal < wrote: 

We got it approved! 
Thanks, 
Sarah 

On Mon, Oct 12, 2015 at 3:18 PM, Sarah Dolezal < > wrote: 

Yes, we call. 
Thanks 

On Mon, Oct 12, 2015 at 3:16 PM, Lesley Groff wrote: <a 

Ok no worries as in sure he will pay if that's what has to be done. I 
will let him know! Do you call the insurance company? Thank 
you. 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Oct 12, 2015, at 3:13 PM, Sarah Dolezal wrote: 

I faxed the script but now his insurance needs to 
authorize so we have to call for approval. I doubt it 
will get approved as we have no X-Rays or Physical 
Therapy notes so he may have to pay cash if they deny. 
Thanks, 
Sarah 
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On Mon, Oct 12, 2015 at 12:00 PM, Lesley Groff 
wrote: 

Hello Amanda and Sarah... 

Just left a vm with Sarah...want to follow up with email (I know it is 
sometimes easier!) Jeffrey would like Dr. Moskowitz 
to please Fax over a script for an MRI of his back to 
the East River Medical Imaging center in NY...Rosie 
is who I made Jeffrey's appointment with and her fax 
# is 

Jeffrey's appointment is for Wed. Oct. 14th at 7:30am 

Might Dr. Moskowitz be able to fax this script over today so we arc all set? 

Please let me know! 

Thank you, 
Lesley 
Assistant to Jeffrey Epstein 

Sarah Dolezal, MSN, ARNP 
Dr. Bruce Moskowitz 

Sarah Dolezal, MSN, ARNP 
Dr. Bruce Moskowitz 

Sarah Dolezal, MSN, ARNP 
Dr. Bruce Moskowitz 
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Sarah Dolczal, MSN, ARNE' 
Dr. Bruce Moskowitz 
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