To:  Lesley Grof |

From: bellaklein
Sent: Mon 9/28/2015 7:28:22 PM
Subject: Re: Receipt - Jeffrey Epstein 9.24.15 (for Kathy Ruemmler/Fekkai Salon)

hi Les,

Please forward attachment
Thank you,

Bella

Tel:

On Sep 28, 2015, at 11:39 AM, Lesley CrroIT_ wrote:

Thank you...the appointment was actually for Kathy Ruemmler.. Jeffrey paid for her
appointments as a gift.

thank you,

Lesley

Assistant to Jeffrey Epstein

On Sep 28,2015, at 11:26 AM, Camila Pombo ||| GG o

Hello,
Attached please find the receipt for Jeffrey Epstein's appointment on 9.24.15.
Please let me know if there is anything else you may need,

Best,
Camila Pombo
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