
To: 
From: 
Sent: Thur 9/24/2015 5:50:18 PM 
Subject: Re: 

Ok. I will have Natasha double check. Perhaps it takes a billing cycle or two 

Sent from my iPhone 

> On Sep 24, 2015, at 1:28 PM, wrote: 

> yes, $2951.12 on 8/26/15 

> Thank you, 
> Bella 

> • Tel: 

>> On Sep 24, 2015, at 1:26 PM, wrote: 

>> Do you see a charge cause I don't thin k it was ever truly booked ? 

» Sent from my iPhone 

>>> On Sep 24, 2015, at 1:22 PM, wrote: 
>» 
>>> don't see credit yet 
>» Thank you, 
>» Bella 
>» 

>>> Tel: 
>>> 
>» 
»» On Sep 24, 2015, at 12:59 PM, wrote: 
>>>> 
»» yes 
>>» 
>>>>> On Sep 24, 2015, at 11:41 AM, wrote: 
>>>» 
>>>» 
>>>>> was the attached hotel reservation cancelled? 
>>>» 
>>>» 
>>>>> Thank you,<Amex_Black_HOTEL MANAPANY SAIN 
cancelled.pdf> 
>>>>> Bella 
>>>>> 
>>>» 
>»» Tel: 
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