
To: 
From: Jeffrey E. 
Sent Thur 9/17/2015 5:56:39 PM 
Subject Re: Hotel in St Barths that I found 

yes, ok 

On Thu, Sep 17, 2015 at 1:54 PM, wrote: 

I found a hotel in St Barths that is willing to let us put 50% down deposit and cancel up to Oct 
1 with only a 5% penalty. The hotel would take $5012 now but we would cancel before Oct 
1 (would cost us about $250 to do this). Considering we have no letter of accommodation yet 
should I book this? 

Sent from my iPhone 
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