
To: Bella Klein 
Cc: Rich Kahn[ 
From: Salm 
Sent: Mon 8/10/2015 6:10:47 PM 
Subject: Re: Jets amex... 

ok, thanks 

On Aug 10, 2015, at 2:04 PM, bellaklein wrote: 

> Just confirmed with Amex Money Gram cash transaction. Should be cleared now. 

> Thank you, 
> Sella 

> • Tel: 

>> On Aug 10, 2015, at 1:54 PM, 

>> I called to book a flight thru Amex and was directed to Fraud 
protection...something must be up...perhaps you already know this? 

wrote: 
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