T, Lesiey cror

From: bellaklein
Sent: Tue 8/18/20156:15:12 PM

subject: Re: zDC_JEE_Wizz Air ||| G i =~_260.98 Euros_072915_was

cancelled

ok, as i taught the flight was cancelled.
Thank wyou,
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> On Aug 18, 2015, at 2:05 PM, Lesley Groff _;« Wrote:

e

> I can't

> Full up the statement. But I do know they threatened to cancel her flight if we
did not provide them with a copy of Jeffrey's CC and a copy of

passport. 530 perhaps the airline cancelled and then once we provided the info
they wanted they reinstated the ticket? 5She did take the flight so we do need to
pay for 1it.

-

> Sent from my iPhone

-

»» On Aug 18, 2015, at 2:01 FM, bellaklein <} ' otc:
-

>> Hi Les,

»>» I am a little concerned, as 1 have a charge, credit to it and a charge again.
Please advise. See statement below

»» <EDC WEFV _JE NY Statement RAugust 2015.xls>
>

»>> Thank you,

>>» Bella
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