
To: 
From: bellaklein 
Sent Thur 7/30/2015 5:22:22 PM 
Subject Re: Delta 

ok:)) it is not 70, it is 70 plus 35 - $105 
Thank you, 
Bella 

On Jul 30, 2015, at 1:19 PM, =.=> wrote: 

oh wait...yes it is! I purchased scats for MY flight yesterday...I am spacing out. I will 
give you another check for $70 on monday. 

On Jul 30, 2015, at 1:14 PM, bellaklein wrote:

ok, I might have names when statement arrives, just checking if it is 
not your flight 

Thank you, 
Bella 

On Jul 30, 2015, at 1:09 PM, 

IMIM> wrote: 

I would think this is the purchase of seats for someones tickets...I know I 
purchase seats sometimes when the flight is full and I 
don't want there to be any problems at the airport... 

On Jul 30, 2015, at 1:00 PM, bellaklein wrote: 

Hi Les, 
Cant find backup for the following charge. 
Please help. 

JUL29 DELTA AIR LINES 
Jeffrey E Epstein 535.00 
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Doing business as 
DELTA AIR LINES 
ATLANTA AIRPORT 
ATLANTA 
GA 
30320 
UNITED STATES 
Category: Travel - Airline 
Would you like to monitor this charge for dispute? 
PRINT 

DELTA AIR 
LINES1438153200000 

JUL29 DELTA AIR LINES 

Doing business as: 
DELTA AIR LINES 
ATLANTA AIRPORT 
ATLANTA 
GA 
30320 
UNITED STATES 
Category: Travel - Airline 

Thank you, 

Bella 
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