To: jeffrey E.[ieevacation@gmail.com]
From: Lesley Groff

Sent: Woed 7/8/2015 7:41:59 PM
Subject: Re:

Done. Will send ticket as soon as | receive

Sent from my iPhone

On Jul 8, 2015, at 3:21 PM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote:

take it.

On Wed, Jul 8, 2015 at 9:20 PM, Lesley Gmﬁ’_b wrote:

Business class from CDG at 9:45am on Air France.. . BUT its

$1067.70

Outbound flight
Thu, Jul 9

6:45 am - 8:45 am

Paris (ORY) — Rome (FCO)
Vueling 6250

2h 00m

No Wi-Fi

No in-seat power

please note
The information contained in this communication is
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It 1s the property of
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