To: Nili Priell Barak | | G

From: Lesley Groff
Sent: Fri 8/21/2015 3:55:52 PM

Subject: Re: Safein 11J

Thx

Sent from my iPhone
On Aug 21, 2015, at 11:24 AM, Nili Priell Barak _‘ wrote:

FYI

Begin forwarded message:

From: Nili Priell Barak | GG

Subject: Re: Safe in 11J
Date: August 21, 2015 at 6:16:07 PM GMT+3

Hello Merwin,

Thanks for up dating me.

We will arrive to NY and the appartment on September 10. I will call you then and
we will fix a meeting.

best regards,

Nili Barak

On Aug 21, 2015, at 6:03 PM, Merwin Dela cruz _

Wrote:

Hi Mrs. Barak,

I have the keys and the code to the safe. Please let me
know when you would like for me to come to the
apartment.

Thank you

6 2015 ar 3-05 PM, Lesley Groff
= OWToLe:

Great. Thank you

Sent from my iPhone

On Aug 6, 2015, at 3:01 P
] VTote:
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Me and the Locksmith will be
there at 4:45pm

Thank you

Merwin Dela Cruz

On Aug 6, 2015, at 2:47 PM, Lesley Groft

Ok good deal.
Hopefully Merwin
can figure out for
you!

Sent from my iPhone

On Aug 6, 2015, at 2:37 PM, Nili Priell Barak

- vrote:

After 3
pm 15
ok.

We
could
not
open
the
safe, so
wC
have
nothing
inside.
[tisa
safe
not
only
with a
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combin
ation
but
with a
key
hole
that's
why it
is
differe
nt from
the
usual
hotel
safes.

Sent from my iPhone

On 6 2183 2015, at 20:37, Lesley Groff

wrotce:

Hi Nili....we can have Merwin come over
today after 3pm to have a look at the safe for
you....Merwin is cc’d here. Could you please
let him know when would be a good time for
him to come by? He is asking if you have
something already in the safe that you or one
of your security people 1s around when he
tries to open the safe for you...I believe it is
Just a combination safe similar to those in
hotels where you put in your own code to
open.

Merwin’s cell:

Nili's coll: |

Thank you! Lesley

On Aug 6, 2015, at 1:06 PM, Nili Priell Barak
® = Wrote;
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hi Lesley

Is there a key to the volt? I cannot open
it. Can you assist?

thanks

Nili
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