
To: 
From: e a t e n 
Sent Thur 6/25/2015 8:49:52 PM 
Subject Re: Amex_Black_JE_Dr Merell_8001or visit oct 2014_062515 

not sure if insurance will cover after 8 month,,, will try 
Thank you, 
Bella 

On Jun 25, 2015, at 4:46 PM, > wrote: 

ok 
On Jun 25, 2015, at 4:41 PM, bellaklein wrote: 

Hi Les, 
Just received a fax from Dr Merrell and paid it. Please submit page 2 
to the insurance company. 

Thank you, 
Bella 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: 
Subject: essage rom 
Date: June 25, 2015 at 4:36:09 I4A EDT 
To: 
Re 
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