From:
Sent: Tue 6/16/2015 5:14:03 PM
Subject: Re: Dr. Chen invoice for Justina - $3375

[ don't think you need his approval. He approved it already. If you want him to see the bill you
can forward to him but I'm sure he knows it was going to be expensive. I have Dr Chen phone
number and will send

Sent from my iPhone

On Jun 16, 2015, at 12:55 PM. bellaklein _ wrote:

H
Do we need JE approval for payment? I would appreciate the office phone number
as they don't have it on the bill.

Thank you,
Bella

Begin forwarded message:

From:

Subject: Message from KMBT_C253
Date: June 16, 2015 at 12:46:57 PM EDT
To:

Reply-To: scanner@hbrkassociates.com
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