
To: 
From: acem 
Sent Tue 6/16/2015 5:44:58 PM 
Subject Re: Dr. Chen invoice for Justina - $3375 

appreciate it 
Thank you, 
Bella 

On Jun 16, 2015, at 1:30 P 

Dr. Chen 
140 West 58th Street, Suite A (between 6th and 7th Ave's) 

On Jun 16, 2015, at 12:55 PM, bellaklein wrote: 

Thank you, 
Bella 

wrote: 

Hi 
Do we need JE approval for payment? I would appreciate the office 
phone number as they don't have it on the bill. 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: 
Subject: Message from KMBT_C253 
Date: June 16, 2015 at 12:46:57 PM EDT 
To: 
Reply-To: SCannerahbrkassociates.com 
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