
To: 
Cc: a el 
From: Lesley Gro 
Sent Sun l3f7/2015 7:33:33 PM 
Subject Re: Dr Lemchen 

I think you mean you received the invoice again. Is it perhaps a receipt and it 
says paid? Or it may have already been set up to send out to you and crossed In 
the mail with payment. 

Sent from my iPhone 

> On Jun 7, 2015, at 3:27 PM, na wrote: 

> Hi Lesley and Bella! 
> I received the check from dr Lemchen again.. Bella, could you verify the 
payment please 
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