
To: bellaklein 
Cc: Rich Kahn 
Fran: 
Sent: Mon 6/1/2015 9:17:54 PM 
Subject: Re: Core Club 

Well that makes sense 

Sent from my iPhone 

> On Jun 1, 2015, at 5:08 PM, bellaklein ‹ > wrote: 

> Annual membership fee as per JE new agreement!! 
> Thank you, 
> Bella 

> Tel: 

>> On Jun 1, 2015, at 3:45 PM, wrote: 

>> holy cow no way! I don't know...Stepanova's bday was ..but I don't 
know if she and 10 of her friends went there! 

>>> On Jun 1, 2015, at 3:43 PM, bellaklein < > wrote: 
>>> 
>>> Hi 
>>> Any idea who used Core club, as I received a charge on JE Amex on May 20th 
for $7,600. 
>>> 
>>> Thank you, 
>>> Bella 
>>> 
>>> 
>» Tel: 
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