
To: Rich Kahn 
From: 
Sent Mon 5/11/2015 8:30:24 PM 
Subject Re: Lesley Car - ML350 Black Order 

ok great 
On May 11, 2015, at 4:29 PM, Richard Kahn wrote: 

sounds good 
whatever time you want 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

On May 11, 2015, at 4:26 PM, 
wrote: 

thank you!! 
hoping we can depart the office like 1:30/2pm? would love to get on the road by 

4pm... 

On May 11, 2015, at 4:19 PM, Richard Kahn e > wrote: 

friday it is 
thanks 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
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On Ma 11, 2015, at 1:38 PM, 
wrote: 

ha! that is so funny to me...of course he doesn't work Wed. 
Yes, can we do Friday? 

On May 11, 2015, at 1:27 PM, Richard Kahn 
> wrote: 

gary is not in on wednesday 
can you do thursday or friday 
thanks 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

On May 11, 2015, 
at 9:34 AM, Lesley 
Groff 
<=iMia 
M. wrote: 

Awesome! Yes wed will work! 

Sent from my iPhone 

On May 11, 2015, at 9:30 AM, Richard Kahn 

wrote: 

officiall 
y good 
to go 
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will 
finalize 
this am 
and 
hope 
for 
pickup 
by mid 
week 
would 
wednes 
day 
work 
for 
pickup 
9 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

Begin forwarded message: 

Date: May 11, 2015 at 9 26 08 AM EDT 
Subject: Re: Lesley Car - ML350 Black 
Order 
From: "Jeffrey E." 
< R evacationeornail.com> 

ok 

On Mon, May 11, 2015 at 9:25 AM, Richard 
Kahn cee wrote: 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
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Begin forwarded message: 

Subject: Fwd: Lesley Car - ML350 
Black Order 
Date: May 7. 2015 at 4:32:51 PM 
EDT 
To: "jeffrey E." 
<jeevacation urnail tom> 

attached is invoice for Mercedes 
ML350 
total cost with nyc sales tax is 
63,628.88 
please advise if ok to purchase in 
DKI PLLC name and register 
with NY plates 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: 

EFTA_R1_00656757 
EFTA02078037



To: 

Subject: ML350 Black 
Order 
Date: May 6. 2015 at 
11:52:39 AM EDT 

Hi Rich , 

Here is the new car order . 

Please sign and send back 
asap . 

I will nccd proof of corp 
for : Darren K. Indyke Pile 

Thanks once again ! 

Best Regards , 

Gary M. Mann 

Master Certified Sales 
Representative 

Mercedes-Benz Manhattan, 
Inc. 
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www.mbmanhattan.com 

If you are not the addressee, 
please inform us immediately 
that you have received this e-
mail by mistake, and delete it. 
We thank you for your support. 

please note 
The information contained in this 
communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, 
may 
constitute inside information, and is intended 
only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of 
this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly 
prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us 
immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to 
jecvacationA,gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies 
thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights 
reserved 
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