
To: Peggy Si 
Cc: Rich Kahn Bella Klein[ 
From: Lesley Gro 
Sent: Mon 5/11/2015 9:37:06 PM 
Subject: Re: Payment information FW: AMFAR - THURSDAY, MAY 21 

Great! Bella, the address is at the very very bottom of this form...by the amfAR logo... 120 Wall 
Street, 13th FI, NY, NY 10005 
On May I I, 2015, at 5:33 PM, Amanda Skarbnik wrote: 

Hi again, 

I will, of course, handle the registration form and everything. 

Below is the details of where you can send the check to. Please just note that it is 
payment for Peggy Siegal. 

Thank you so much! 
Best, 
Amanda 

From: Christina Christofi 
Sent: Monday, May 11, 2015 4:53 PM 
To: Amanda Skarbnik; amfAR Cinema Against AIDS 
Subject: Re: AMFAR - THURSDAY, MAY 21 

Hi Amanda, 

Following our conversation, attached please find the registration form for our event. Please 
fill this out at your earliest convenience. Please send the check to our NY office to my 
attention and please make the check out to amfAR: 

amfAR, The Foundation for AIDS Research 
120 Wall Street, 13th floor 
New York, NY 10005 

Please let me know if you have any additional questions. We look forward to having Peggy 
join us at Cinema Against AIDS 22 on May 21st. 

Best, 
Christina 

Christina Christoll 
Manager. Special Events 

Cinema Against AIDS 22 Office 
(May 10th- May 24th) 
34. Boulevard ci' Alsace, 06400 Cannes 
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amfAR, The Foundation for AIDS Research 
'20 '.".'21 St'ett ; 

o . 

From: Amanda Skarbnik 
Date: Monday, May 11, 2015 at 10:39 PM 
To: amfAR Cinema Against AIDS
Subject: AMFAR - THURSDAY, M 

Hi Christina, 

Can you please give me a call ASAP? I'm reaching out in regards to the Cinema Against 
Aids Gala in Cannes on Thursday, May 21". 

Peggy's friend, Jeffrey Epstein, is going to purchase a ticket on Peggy's behalf. We need 
to know where to send the check. 

Best, 
Amanda 

siest Siegal
<Cinema Against AIDS 22 Registration Form.pdf> 
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