
To: Ike Groffill il 
From: Lesley Groff 
Sent Mon 5/11/2015 1:38:59 PM 
Subject: Fwd: Lesley Car - ML350 Black Order 

Wednesday! 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Richard Kahn 
Subject: Fwd: Lesley Car - ML350 Black Order 
Date: May 11. 2015 at 9:30:42 AM EDT 
To: Lesley Groff MIMIM 

officially good to go 
will finalize this am and hope for pickup by mid week 
would wednesday work for pickup? 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 
tell= 
fa 
cc 

Begin forwarded message: 

Date: May 11, 2015 at 9:26:08 AM EDT 
Subject: Re: Lesley Car - ML350 Black Order 
From: "jeffrey E." leevacationOamail.com>
To: Richard Kahn 

ok 

On Mon, May 11, 2015 at 9:25 AM, Richard Kahn 
wrote: 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 
tel 
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fax 
cel 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Richard Kahn 
Subject: Fwd: Lesley ar - ML350 Black rder 
Date: May 7, 2015 at 4:32:51 PM EDT 
To: "jeffrey E." <jeevacationaomail.com>

attached is invoice for Mercedes ML350 
total cost with nyc sales tax is 63,628.88 
please advise if ok to purchase in DKI 
PLLC name and register with NY plates 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York, NY 10022 
tel
fax 
cc 

Begin forwarded message: 

To: 

u jec : MLsou tsiac 
Order 
Date: May 6, 2015 at 
11 52 39 AM EDT 

Hi Rich , 
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Here is the new car order . 

Please sign and send back asap - 

I will need proof of corp for : Darren K. Indyke Pllc . 

Thanks once again ! 

Best Regards , 

Gary M. Mann 

Master Certified Sales Representative 

Mercedes-Benz Manhattan, Inc. 

770 11 th Ave Btw 53rd St & 541° St 

New York, NY 10019 

Tel: 

Fax 

garv.mann@mbusa.com 

www.mbnianhattan.com 

If you are not the addressee. please inform us immediately that you have 
received this e-mail by mistake. and 
delete it. We thank you for your 
support. 
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please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jecvacation@smail.com and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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