
To: 
From: 
Sent 
Subject 

great , 
Thank you, 
Bella 

bellaklein 
Mon 4/27/2015 6:30:53 PM 
Re: Fedex 

On Apr 27, 2015, at 2:20 PM, wrote: 

Is it a charge for a fed ex to Washington ? We shipped a box to Kathy Ruemmler last 
week. 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Apr 27, 2015, at 2:14 PM, bellaklein wrote: 

Thank you, 
Bella 

ok, Nis the other charge from you? 

On Apr 27, 2015, at 2:11 PM, 
wrote: 

YES this is approved 
Jege Inc 
parts for Boeing 727 

thx 
Larry v 

—Original Message--
From: bellaklein 
To: 
Sent: Mon, Apr 27, 2015 2:08 pm 
Subject: Fedex 

Larry visosky 

EFTA_R1_00660439 
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and Larry, 

Please confirm the attached fedex charges. 

Thank you, 
Sella 
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