
To: Melanie S inella 
From: 
Sent Mon 5/4/2015 4:45:47 PM 
Subject Re: breakfast with Leon 

I will find out if that would work on JE's end...will get back to you.. 
On May 4, 2015, at 12:41 PM, Melanie Spinella wrote: 

According to my calendar he can't do any of those — let me see what he says when he 
calls and I'll let you know. He could do breakfast on Wednesday?? 

From: 
Sent: Monday, May 04, 2015 12:39 PM 
To: Melanie Spinella 
Subject: Re: breakfast with Leon 

Melanie...I am afraid we must cancel the breakfast tomorrow...might Leon be 
available on WEd. or Thurs? Jeffrey could do lunch or dinner on Wed, breakfast 
or lunch on Thurs...or feel free to suggest a time on either day! thanks so much, 
Lesley 

On May 4, 2015, at 10:37 AM, Melanie Spinella 
wrote: 

Leon said he will be at your home tomorrow at 9:15am for breakfast - thanks 

Melanie Spinella I Apollo Management 
9West 57th Street New York New York 10019 
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