To:

From: Allison Yorke

Sent: Mon 4/27/2015 8:12:36 PM
Subject: RE: Jeffrey Epstein

Hi Lesley,

Per our conversation- | discussed with Maya.. We are going to upgrade her phone on Monday., We are
happy to take care of it and pay for the upgrade. Just wanted to let you know the upgrade might cause
the monthly bill amount to change. We are happy to switch over everything and take over the monthly
payments. But | wanted to check with you first. Please advise.

Thank you!

Best

Allison

erom: [

Sent: Wednesday, April 22, 2015 3:16 PM
To: Bella Klein

Cc: Allison Yorke

Subject: Re: leffrey Epstein

great! thanks bella

On Apr 22, 2015, at 3:13 PM, bellaklein -:_- wrote: -

Hi Alison,

The phone is eligible for upgrade. The service is with ATT. You can always login
to the account for all needed information. User 1D:
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Below please find details about the phone eligibility:

This line is upgrade eligible for a new smartphone with $0 down on AT&T Next.
Reminder: Taxes are due at the time of purchase. This line may be eligible for an
upgrade with a 2-year wiraless agreement on September 21, 2015. For Mobile Share
Value Plan customers, the $15/325 discounts are not available with an upgrade to a new
2-year wireless agreement.

Thank vou,

Bella

r22. 2015, at 2:57 PM., Allison Yorke
wrote:

Thank you!

----- Original Message-----

From: Lesley Groff [mailto:leslev jeefidgmail com]

Sent: Wednesday, April 22, 2015 2:43 PM

To: Allison Yorke

Cc: Bella Klemn

Subject: Jeffrey Epstein

Hello Allison...I have asked Bella in our accounting department to please have a
look to see if phone number [ s duc for an upgrade...she

will get back to us when she can...

Thanks! Lesley

EFTA_R1_00661585
EFTA02080018



