
To: merwin dela cruz 
Fontanilla 
From: 
Sent Mon 4/20/2015 3:22:28 PM 
Subject Fwd: Contour Outlet: New Order # 200022760 

j; Jojo 

We should receive this order TODAY! they tried to deliver on Sat. April 18 but could not 
because no one was here obviously...the post office has this and is to redeliver today...if you don't 
receive, please let me know as we will need to investigate...thanks 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: 
Subject: Fwd: Contour Outlet: New Order # 200022760 
Date: April 15, 2015 at 9:26:18 AM EDT 
To: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@omail.com>

I have ordered your 2 EXTRA LARGE BUTT Toners ;) 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Contour Outlet <customercare(W.teksmartfitness.com>
Subject: Contour Outlet: New Order # 200022760 
Date: April 15, 2015 at 9:26:31 AM EDT 
To: Jeffrey Lesley Epstein 

Hello, Jeffrey Lesley Epstein 
Thank you for ordering from Contour Technology, LLC. Please allow up to 10 business day for delivery 
If your package has not arrived within 10 business days please email 

tr):.ir`rservice@teksmartfitness.com 

NOTE: If you placed your order and would like it shipped to a different address please 
contact customer service at 844-248-6072, Monday - Friday, 9am - 5pm PST or email: 

customerservice@teksmartfitness.com 

Your order confirmation is below. Thank you again for your business. 

Your Order #200022760 (placed on April 15, 2015 8:26:25 AM CDT) 

Billing Information: Payment Method: 
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Jeffrey Lesley Epstein 
9 East 71st Street 
New York, New York, 10021 
United States 
T: 212 750 9895 

Credit Card Payment 

Credit Card Type: 
American Express 
Credit Card Number: 
xxxx-3001 

Payer Email: 
lesley.jee©grnail.corn 

Shipping Information: Shipping Method: 

Jeffrey Lesley Epstein 
9 East 71st Street 
New York, New York, 10021 
United States 
T: 212 750 9895 

Shipping Option - Standard Delivery 

Item Sku Qty Subto 

Curvassure Butt Toning CBS2000-CBS200XL 2 $259 
System 
Size 
x- la rge 

Subtotal $259 

Delivery Charge $17 

Grand Total ;277. 

Thank you, Teksmart Fitness, LLC 
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