Cc:

From: Bebe Avdiu
Sent: Thur 4/16/2015 4.02:06 PM
Subject: Re: Jeffrey Epstein

Hi Jose,
[ just tried calling your cellphone. I have a question regarding the Agreement.

At your earliest convenience, please call me back atjj |

Thank You,

Bebe Avdiu
Legal Assistant
DARREN K. INDYKE, PLLC
375 Lexmgton Avenue, 4th Floor

New York, New York 10022
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Ihe information contained in this communication is confidential, may be attormey-client privileged, and is intended only for the
use of the addresses.

It is the property of Darren K. Indyke, PLLC. Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this communication or any part
thereol is strictly prohibited

and may be unlawful. If vou have received this communication in error, please notify us immediately by return e-mail, and
destroy this communication

and all copies thereof, including all attachments

Copyright of Darren K. Indyke, PLLC - © 2015 Darren K. Indyke, PLLC — All rights reserved.
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On Apr 16, 2015, at 11:46 AM, _ wrote:

surc

On Apr 16, 2015, at 11:31 AM, Jose Guerrero ~_ wrote:
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Okay should I send you new W-9 for Merwin 7

Jose Guerrero
Assistant Location Manager
NBC Universal //

"ODYSSEY"
C/O Broadway Stages
359 Kingsland Ave 5F]
Brooklyn, NY

On Apr 16, 2015, at 11:06 AM, _ wrote:

Sorry about that.. Jeffrey most definitely wants Mr.
Soderbergh to donate the $5000 to his charity! Bebe has
stepped out of the office..once she returns she can fix
what needs to be fixed...thank you for the generous $500
for Merwin!

On Apr 16, 2015, at 11:04 AM, Jose Guerrero

Hi Lesley and Bebe I'm confused the W-9
was for Merwin for the 500 we're paying
him. If you guys want to handle the donation
[ will have to put the $5,000 dollars in the
photo release. It's a simple fix just add a line
with the 5,000.00 dollar payment. If you
want us to handle the donation we don' need
your W-9 let me know how you would like
to proceed.

Jose Guerrero

Assistant Location Manager

NBC Universal //
"ODYSSEY"

C/O Broadway Stages

359 Kingsland Ave 5FI

Brooklyn, NY
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On Apr 16, 2015, at 10:29 AM, Bebe Avdiu

- Vot

Good morning Jose,
Attached please find a PDF of
the signed Agreement and W9.

Thank You.

<Exterior Filming Release.pdf=>

Bebe Avdiu
Legal Assistant
DARREN K. INDYKE, PLLC

575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor
Mew York, New York 10022
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I'he information contained in this communication is confidential, may be attorney-
client privileged, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee

It is the property of Darren K. Indvke, PLLC. Unauthorized use, disclosure or
copying of this communication or any part
thereal is strictly prohibited

and may be unlawfl. If vou have received this commumcation in error, please notify
us immediately by return e-mail, and
destroy this communication

and all copies thereof, including all attachments

Copyright of Darren K. Indyke, PLLC - © 2015 Darren
K. Indyke, PLLC — All rights
reserved.
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On Apr 16, 2015, at 10:13 AM, Jose Guerrero

wrote:

Thank you -

Jose Guerrero

Assistant Location Manager

NBC Universal //
"ODYSSEY"

C/O Broadway Stages

359 Kingsland Ave 5FI

Brooklyn, NY

On Apr 16, 2015, at 9:55 AM,

Jose,
we will
have
this
signed,
scanne
d and
emaile
d back
today...
Please
expect
an
email
trom
Bebe in
our
office..
thanks
On Apr
15,
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2015,
at 8:57
PM,
Jose
Guerre
o

wrote:

Good evening [ INGN.

Attached you will find the photo release paper
work along with a W-9 for Merwin please
sign and send it back to me as soon as you can
This will allow me to proceed with the
donation

Jose Guerrero
Assistani Location Manager
NBC Universal

"ODYSSEY'
CA0 Broadway Stages
303 Kingsland ave Sniy FI
Brooklve, NJY 11222

great!!!

On Apr 15, 2015, at 7:28 PM, Jose Guerrero

= Thank you. I will call him tomorrow.

> Jose Guerrero
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> Assistant Location Manager
> NBC Universal //

> "ODYSSEY"

= (/O Broadway Stages

> 359 Kmgsland Ave 5F]

> Brooklyn, NY

>>On Apr 15, 2015

at 7:03 PM. -

Wrote:

=> Hello Jose, Merwin is happy to be your
point person for the shoot. He 1s ced here. His
cell number

e

== Merwin 15 the best and will be a
tremendous help I'm sure! Thanks,
|

>> Sent from my 1Phone

<Photo Release 9 E 7lst
St LocationAgreement.docx=<HBO W-
9 pdf=
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