
To: 
From: 
Sent 
Subject: Re: BMW approved! 

Mon 4/20/2015 5:12:44 PM 

Thanks so much Rich...this is very generous of Jeffrey and I very much appreciate 
it!!! I will get back to you probably end of the week... :) 

on Apr 20, 2015, at 1:09 PM, Richard Kahn < > wrote: 

> great news''''' 
> you deserve it!! 

> please let me know when you have some numbers i can review and negotiate 
> thanks 

> Richard Kahn 
> HBRK Associates Inc. 
> 575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
> New 
> tel 
> fax 
> cell 

>> On Apr 20, 2015, at 12:35 PM, IC wrote: 
>> 
>> HI Rich...I was in speaking with Jeffrey and he said OK to the BMW! So very 
happy... 

» just wanted you to know! 
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