
To: 
From: 
Sent 
Subject: Re: Your Room Is Paid For... 

Fri 3/27/2015 6:47:06 PM 

Ok great ! Thank you Lesley! 

On Thursday, March 26, 2015, Lesley Groff ‹ > wrote: 

minor expenses...lunch or a water at the pool type thing :) 

On Mar 26, 2015, at 4:40 PM, wrote: 

Hi Lesley, on great just checked in ) what do you mean by incidentals ? 

On Thursday, March 26, 2015, Lesley Groff ‹ > wrote: 

just want to make sure you know your room and incidentals are paid for 
by Jeffrey...1 filled out the credit authorization form and sent to Ivanna Goodman 
at the front desk (PBX Operator) yesterday....you shouldn't have any problems! 

Thanks, Lesley 

Sincere! 

Sincere! 
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