
To: bellaklei 
From: 
Sent Wed 4/15/2015 8:39:28 PM 
Subject Re: JE Insurance. 

Ok 

Sent from my iPhone 

> On Apr 15, 2015, at 4:27 PM, bellaklein wrote:

> Hi IIII 
> Please submit to insurance company JE bills 

> • Thank you, 
> <Amex_Black_JE_Dr Mitchell Kline_675_040815_dermathologiest.pdf> 
> <Amex Black JE Dr Mitchell Kline _850 850 040815 dermathologiest.pdf> _ _ _ 

> Bella 

> • Tel: 
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